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For the characters in Segun Afolabi's debut collection, 'elsewhere' is a place they must transform into home.
In the award-winning 'Monday Morning' a refugee boy puzzles out his place in a new land. A bereaved
father in 'Arithmetic' thinks back to a confusing, youthful sexual encounter that has left him emotionally
scarred; Jacinta faces a long retirement with a husband she is not sure she likes in 'Jumbo and Jacinta' and
'The Wine Guitar' tells the story of an aging musician who pays a prostitute for the gift of her youth.

These are tales of diaspora, of people making their lives in new lands. Moving, funny and occasionally
shocking, Afolabi's stories reflect the way we live now.

A Life Elsewhere was shorlisted for the Commonwealth Writers' Prize.
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From reader reviews:

Nicole Dilbeck:

This A Life Elsewhere book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands.
The benefit you obtain by reading this book will be information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will
get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This kind of A Life
Elsewhere without we comprehend teach the one who reading it become critical in imagining and analyzing.
Don't be worry A Life Elsewhere can bring any time you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves'
grow to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This A Life Elsewhere
having excellent arrangement in word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Ronnie Johnson:

This book untitled A Life Elsewhere to be one of several books that best seller in this year, honestly, that is
because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind
of book in the book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason
to you to past this reserve from your list.

Kimberly Dyer:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping A Life Elsewhere that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the world
can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better then how they react to the world. It
can't be claimed constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who
wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you are able to pick A Life Elsewhere become your own personal starter.

Ruth Davis:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of A Life Elsewhere can give you a lot of pals
because by you considering this one book you have thing that they don't and make an individual more like an
interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information
that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than various other make you to be great people. So ,
why hesitate? Let us have A Life Elsewhere.
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